Agenda Item No. F - 9!

DATE SUBMITTED November 9, 2020 COUNCIL ACTION A
PUBLIC HEARING REQUIRED “( )

SUBMITTED BY Public Services RESOLUTION ()
ORDINANCE 15T READING ()

DATE ACTION REQUIRED November 18, 2020 ORDINANCE 2N READING ()
CITY CLERK’S INITIALS (

IMPERIAL CITY COUNCIL
AGENDA ITEM
SUBJECT: Hot DISCUSSION/ACTION:
Box
1. Discuss, Approve/Disapprove the purchase of budgeted equipment for Streets.

DEPARTMENT INVOLVED:

Public Services

BACKGROUND/SUMMARY:

Staff requesting to purchase budgeted item from KM International. Recommending to purchase a Hot
Box to keep asphalt mix at needed temperature for street repair and maintenance.

FISCAL IMPACT:
$29,430.00 — KM International (Budgeted $30,000)

100% - Streets 01-320-5442

FINANCE
INITIALS

STAFF RECOMMENDATION: Approve

DEPT. INITIALS

MANAGER’S RECOMMENDATION: CITY

MANAGER'’s

INITIALS
MOTION:
SECONDED: APPROVED () REJECTED ()
AYES: DISAPPROVED () DEFERRED ()
NAYES:
ABSENT: REFERRED TO:




K M INTERNATIONAL
6561 BERNIE KOHLER DRIVE

KMIl QUOTE

taxes imposed upon Seller with respect to its overall net income) and costs, expenses and reasonable

Date Estimate #
11/5/2020 31413
Name / Address Ship To
CITY OF IMPERIAL CITY OF IMPERIAL
ISATIAH GONZALEZ IMPERIAL, CA 99251
IMPERIAL, CA 99251
P.O. No. Terms Rep Delivery
Net 30 CcC PO+30 DAYS
ltem Description Qty Cost Total
KM 8000TEDD C2M2 KM 8000TEDD C2M2- 4 TON ASPHALT 26,030.00 26,030.00T
HOTBOX/RECLAIMER DIESEL FIRED HYDRAULIC DUMP
TRAILER (18' STD) WITH ELECTRIC BRAKES,
FREIGHT - NORTH BRANCH FOB - DOOR NORTH BRANCH, MI 48461 TO DOOR 99251 3,250.00 3,250.00T
HANDLING HANDLING/PACKAGING AND/OR CRATE CHARGES 150.00 150.00T
NCPA CONTRACT PRICING- KM INTERNATIONAL NCPA
CONTRACT 05-25
Out-of-state sale, exempt from sales tax 0.00% 0.00
Tax Indemnification. Buyer shall pay, and indemnify and hold Seller, and its Affiliates, and all officers,
directors, employees and agents harmless from and against, any taxes that may at any time be asserted
in respect of the transactions described in this purchase order, or the Buyer’s use or possession of the
equipment that is the subject of this purchase order (including any sales, use, receipts, value added,
occupation, excise, personal property, privilege or license taxes, or any withholdings, but not includin
P p property, privileg y gs, bul ¢ | Total $29,430.00

counsel fees in defending against the same, whether arising by reason of the Buyer’s purchase, use or

| possession of the equipment or otherwise

Quoted By:

Phone # Fax #

Accepted

(810) 688-1234 (810) 688-8765

Kaizer-Morris Internalional, Inc,

Please note that ALL WARRANTY PARTS must be
returned to KMI within 7 business days of customer
receipt in order for credit to be issued.




Jisela Solorzano
_————————————— = = e e e ]

From: Michael Blake <mblake@kminternational.com>

Sent: Monday, November 9, 2020 6:45 AM

To: Jisela Solorzano

Cc Edgar Self; Jackie Loper

Subject: RE: KM International NCPA Quote for KM 8000TEDD Asphalt Hotbox Reclaimer
Attachments: Fwd: NCPA - New Member

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the City of Imperial. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good Moring,

Spoke with Edgar, Friday afternoon and confirmed with him that the City of Imperial was approved as an NCPA
member. See email attached confirming NCPA confirmation.

The contract number is 05-25 under the Roadway Maintenance Equipment and Supplies category.
http://ncpa.us/Vendors/KM%20International

If there are any additional questions please let me know.

Michael Blake
Director of Marketing
KM International

From: Jisela Solorzano <jsolorzano@cityofimperial.org>

Sent: Friday, November 06, 2020 11:57 AM

To: Michael Blake <mblake@kminternational.com>

Cc: Edgar Self <eself@cityofimperial.org>; Jackie Loper <jloper@cityofimperial.org>
Subject: RE: KM International NCPA Quote for KM 8000TEDD Asphalt Hotbox Reclaimer

| don’t believe so- if anything leave a message and he can return your call at his earliest convenience if he does not
answer. Thank you

Thank you,

Jisela Solorzano
Administrative Assistant
Public Services

City of Imperial

Office: (760) 355-2155 | Fax: (760) 355-4718
420 S Imperial Avenue
Imperial, CA 92251

www.imperial.ca.qov

In response to the COVID-19 pandemic, the City of Imperial has closed our public facilities. We continue to offer assistance to our residents and
businesses over the phone and by email. We encourage everyone to follow health and safety practices recommended by the Center of Disease



Control and California Department of Public Health, stay home unless otherwise shopping for essential needs, and visit our website at
www.cityofimperial.org/covid19 for information and resources.

En respuesta a la pandemia por COVID-19, la Ciudad de Imperial ha cerrado todas sus instalaciones publicas. Continuaremos ofreciendo nuestra
ayuda a residentes y negocios por medio de teléfono y correo electronico. Les invitamos a seguir las medidas de salud y seguridad recomendadas
por el Centro de Control de Enfermedades y el Departamento de Salud Publica de California, permanezca en casa a menos que sea para comprar por
necesidades esenciales y visite nuestro sitio de internet www.cityofimperial.org/covid19 para mayor informacién y recursos disponibles.

From: Michael Blake <mblake@kminternational.com>

Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 8:41 AM

To: Jisela Solorzano <jsolorzano@cityofimperial.org>

Cc: Edgar Self <eself@cityofimperial.org>; Jackie Loper <jloper@cityofimperial.org>
Subject: RE: KM International NCPA Quote for KM 8000TEDD Asphalt Hotbox Reclaimer

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the City of Imperial. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Jisela,

| will reach out to Edgar today to discuss. Is there a certain time that works better?

Michael Blake
Director of Marketing
KM International

From: Jisela Solorzano <jsolorzano@cityofimperial.org>

Sent: Thursday, November 05, 2020 7:01 PM

To: Michael Blake <mblake@kminternational.com>

Cc: Edgar Self <eself@cityofimperial.org>; Jackie Loper <jloper@cityofimperial.org>
Subject: RE: KM International NCPA Quote for KM 8000TEDD Asphalt Hotbox Reclaimer

Good afternoon,

Do you mind giving Edgar a call at 760-604-7726. He is our Public Services Manager. He has some questions regarding
this quote and if you work with Sourcewell, formerly NJPA. We do not have a good contact number for you.

Thank you,

Jisela Solorzano
Administrative Assistant
Public Services

City of Imperial

Office: (760) 355-2155 | Fax: (760) 355-4718
420 S Imperial Avenue
Imperial, CA 92251

www.imperial.ca.qov

In response to the COVID-19 pandemic, the City of Imperial has closed our public facilities. We continue to offer assistance to our residents and
businesses over the phone and by email. We encourage everyone to follow health and safety practices recommended by the Center of Disease
Control and California Department of Public Health, stay home unless otherwise shopping for essential needs, and visit our website at
www.cityofimperial.org/covid19 for information and resources.




En respuesta a la pandemia por COVID-19, la Ciudad de Imperial ha cerrado todas sus instalaciones publicas. Continuaremos ofreciendo nuestra
ayuda a residentes y negocios por medio de teléfono y correo electrénico. Les invitamos a seguir las medidas de salud y seguridad recomendadas
por el Centro de Control de Enfermedades y el Departamento de Salud Publica de California, permanezca en casa a menos que sea para comprar por
necesidades esenciales y visite nuestro sitio de internet www.cityofimperial.org/covid19 para mayor informacién y recursos disponibles.

From: Isaiah Gonzalez

Sent: Thursday, November 5, 2020 12:47 PM

To: Jackie Loper <jloper@cityofimperial.org>; Edgar Self <eself@cityofimperial.org>

Cc: lisela Solorzano <jsolorzano@cityofimperial.org>

Subject: Fwd: KM International NCPA Quote for KM 8000TEDD Asphalt Hotbox Reclaimer

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Michael Blake <mblake@kminternational.com>

Date: November 5, 2020 at 7:59:58 AM PST

To: Isaiah Gonzalez <IGonzalez@cityofimperial.org>

Subject: KM International NCPA Quote for KM 8000TEDD Asphalt Hotbox Reclaimer

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the City of Imperial. Do not click links or open attachments unless yo!
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good Morning,

| received your information from Carl Morris over at M&M Distribution. Carl said you were
interested in purchasing a KM 8000TEDD Asphalt Hotbox using our NCPA government contract

pricing.

| have attached the quote as requested. If you have any questions regarding the machine itself
or using our NCPA contract please let me know.

Thank You,

Michael M. Blake
Director of Marketing

mblake@kminternational.com
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City of Imperial
City/Town/Village/Borough
956000725

Public Services

Isaiah Gonzalez

420 South Imperial Ave

Imperial
California
United States
92251
17605400723

igonzalez@cityofimperial.org

Another Agency - City of El Centro

11/4/2020 3:25:06 PM




